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What I Am Thankful For… 
 

I am thankful for many things. One thing I am thankful for is my mom. 
My mom is the best mom I could ever have. She does a lot of things for me 
and my brother. One thing she does for us is she cooks for us. She always 
makes us breakfast, lunch, and dinner. Another thing she does is she cares 
for us. If we are upset, my mom always helps us feel better. She also 
makes sure we are healthy and clean. She takes us to the doctor is we are 
sick. She also makes sure we take showers and brush our teeth. 
Sometimes, we might think she is mean for making us do something, but 
really she is just doing what is best for us. Finally, my mom helps my 
brother and I if either of us need help. I love my mom, and I am very 
thankful for her.  

Another thing I am thankful for is my dad. My dad works all the time 
so that our family can have money for food, water, shelter, and a lot more. I 
know he works very hard just for us. My dad is very nice and thoughtful. He 
does some things that my mom won’t do. One thing he does is, he takes us 
sledding in the winter. When it snows, we go to the hill near our house and 
ride our sleds. My dad also rides on roller coasters with us. My mom 
doesn’t like to go on some roller coasters, so my dad rides with my brother 
and me. Finally, my dad plays sports with my brother and me. My mom 
doesn’t play sports, so my dad plays with us. He’ll play basketball, 
baseball, hockey, and soccer. He’ll also ride bikes with me. I love my dad 
and I am very thankful for him.  

Those are the things that I’m thankful for. 


